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Love on the Spectrum is an Australian
reality series that follows a number of young
adults on the autism spectrum, as they search
for love and go on dates with others who also
are on the spectrum. The show ran for two
seasons, in 2019 and 2021, and was recently
also made in a US version. The series was
generally well-reviewed both by people who
themselves are on the spectrum and by
neurotypical viewers. Much of the charm of
the series is that it evokes laughter,
frequently at the seriousness of the people it
portrays. My talk will explore how the series
invites viewers to find the protagonists’
serious behaviour funny. I will compare the
laughter raised during Love on the Spectrum
with laughter encouraged by British
comedian Ricky Gervais’s 2012-2014 series
Derek, which is about a character whom
many viewers identified as being on the
autism spectrum. I will discuss similarities
between the two series, but will conclude by
proposing that the laughter invited by
seriousness during these two series in fact is
structured very differently.
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